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Introduction 
 “Ensuring that our educational system is a doorway to opportunity – and 
not a point of entry to our criminal justice system – is a critical, and 
achievable, goal.”  

-U.S. Attorney General Eric Holder 
 

Among the most significant failings of the legal system for children is the 
extension of its retribution- and incapacitation-based criminal justice 
policies and practices to schools. Primary and secondary educational 
institutions are tasked with preparing children to be constructive, 
productive, and responsible members of society. Ideally, the schools 
provide secure places for academic and social learning and growth, 
including the inevitable juvenile and adolescent mistakes that accompany 
that process.1,2 Adoption of punitive “zero tolerance” approaches in the 
early 1990s and the subsequent increase in the involvement of and 
reliance on law enforcement for school discipline has dramatically 
expanded the number of suspensions and expulsions, threatening the 
ability of schools to serve their primary role of educating children.3 Such 
exclusionary discipline has substantial negative effects on schools and 
students’ life outcomes.4 Removing students through suspension is 
associated with decreased overall student achievement and perceived 
positive school climate.5 Further, controlling for school and individual 
characteristics, students who are suspended or expelled for non-
dangerous behaviors are substantially more likely to become involved in 
the criminal justice system,6 a well-documented phenomeon now widely 
known as the “school-to-prison pipeline.”3  

Given these long-term negative consequences, it is particularly 
concerning that the effects of criminalizing school discipline falls most 
heavily on minorities.7 Decades of research consistently shows that 
students of color, particularly African American males, are at significantly 
higher risk for exposure to exclusionary school discipline practices, 
including office discipline referrals (ODRs) and suspensions.7 Moreover, 
as indicated in Figure 1, a longitudinal comparison of discipline rates 
shows that, overall, the magnitude of that racial and ethnic disparity in 
school discipline (henceforth called disproportionality) is increasing.8 
Indeed, in some districts, over half of all African American males were 
suspended at least once each year.  
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Notes: Suspension data from the U.S. Department of Education-
Office for Civil Rights; 1972-73 US DOE-OCR data archived in9.  

 
To be sure, schools are not alone. Similar racial and ethnic 

disparities exist in components of the legal system that are designed to 
serve youth. For example, African American youth are placed in foster 
care at over twice the rate of white children (see National Council of 
Juvenile and Family Court Judges). Similarly, the juvenile delinquency 
case rate for African American adolescents is more than twice that of their 
white peers (see National Center for Juvenile Justice). But schools are 
unique in the extent of their early interactions with children, their 
educational mission, and their potential influence as the primary 
intervention to prepare youth of today for success tomorrow. As a result, 
the US Department of Justice and US Department of Education have 
recognized school discipline disproportionality as one of the more 
significant challenges they face9,10 (for more information see eg, 
Coordinating Council on Juvenile Justice and Delinquency Prevention). 

A number of structural explanations for disproportionality have been 
proposed (e.g. poverty, different base rates of problem behavior), but 
none have empirical support. African American students are referred and 
suspended at higher rates than their White peers, even after controlling for 
individual SES and other demographic variables.12,13 Similarly, there is no 
published research demonstrating that students of color—and African 
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American students in particular—have higher base rates of problem 
behavior.8 Research by Bradshaw, et al. found that African American 
students were significantly more likely to receive ODRs, even when 
controlling for teacher ratings of their disruptive behavior.14 The results of 
other research has shown that White students are more often issued 
ODRs for relatively objective problem behaviors, which are easily 
classified (e.g. smoking, vandalism), whereas African American students 
are more often issued ODRs for more ambiguous or subjective problem 
behaviors (e.g. disruption)15 which require a judgment call regarding 
whether to refer the student. These consistent findings indicate that—
although structural factors may explain some of the differences—
conscious or unconscious racial bias may also play an important role in 
the discipline gap.  

Thus, at present, there is a solid research base documenting the 
extent of disproportionality and many of its effects. By comparison, 
empirical work identifying specific malleable variables that could be acted 
upon to reduce disparities and testing the validity of interventions targeting 
them in educational settings is in its infancy. As a result, educators trying 
to address the issue are left with few empirically validated options to 
reduce disproportionality at the school level. Although some schools and 
districts have shown improved outcomes,16 these results are not the norm, 
and without clear options, many school and district teams sometimes 
enact policies that have been shown to increase—rather than decrease—
disproportionality, including zero tolerance policies themselves.5 However, 
there is a considerable base of research from other disciplines and 
domains, including social psychology and research on racial and gender 
bias in the workplace and legal settings, that could provide valuable 
guidance in schools. A careful examination of theories in the broader 
literature that may explain disproportionality could enhance our ability to 
address this critical threat to equitable education and the opportunities for 
children that go along with it. 

The purpose of this article is constructive, to move past 
identification of failures of educational and legal systems in efforts to 
inform and improve efforts to resolve it. To do so, we offer a conceptual 
model of bias and discipline disproportionality based on research from 
educational, cognitive, and social psychology. The intent of the model is to 
help identify malleable variables for intervention that have not been used, 
as well as indicate which variables may be more effective targets for 
efforts to reduce disproportionality in schools. We then describe a 
multicomponent school-wide intervention for reducing disproportionality 
and enhancing outcomes for students who are culturally and linguistically 

3

McIntosh et al.: Reducing Disproportionality in School Discipline

Published by DigitalCommons@The Texas Medical Center, 2014



 

diverse. Each component is designed to be implemented within
than supplant—current school
propose a line of future research to validate the model and the 
interventions it recommends. 

 
Hypothesized Factors Leading to Disproportionality in School 

A common understanding of disproportionality relies on a unidimensional 
conceptualization of bias in decision
(e.g. racism). The left side of Figure 2 illustrates this unidimensional 
conceptualization, with racial bias as the sole predictor of disproportionate 
discipline. In this view, to reduce disproportionality, personal racial biases 
must be changed (e.g.
has at least two serious disadvantages. First, it focuses solely on one 
variable that has been shown in many studies to be highly resistant to 
change. Interventions intended to reduce personal racial biases are 
frequently ineffective and have even strengthened existing levels of racial 
bias.17-20 Second, this view fails to consider contextual variables that may 
be as critical to biased decision making but are much more malleable. 

 
Figure 2: Unidimensional and Multidimensional 

Unidimensional Conceptualization 
of Bias. 

 
Presenting a constructive alternative, decades of social

psychological research suggest 
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conceptualization under which, with no change to 
beliefs, an individual may selectively show racial bias in different decision 
situations. For example, a teacher may make more equitable discipline 
decisions at the start of the day but be more likely to send students of 
color to the office at the end of the day, when fatigue affects decision 
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making.22 The core insight of this view is that the interaction between 
individuals’ biases and the situation leads to biased decision making.23,24 
This multidimensional theory has two advantages over the unidimensional 
view. First, it is more accurate in predicting biased decision making.25 
Second, it facilitates identification of solutions to seemingly intractable 
problems.26, 20 However, the multidimensional view also requires a more 
precise understanding of bias and decision-making. 

 
Different Processes, Different Racial Biases, Different Solutions 
In the unidimensional view, bias is often considered to be a single 
personality trait. A substantial body of research from social cognition 
psychology, however, suggests that there are two distinct types of bias 
(explicit and implicit), each associated, in what are called dual-process 
models, with one of two different types of cognitive processing.27,28 The 
first type of processing (generally known as System 1) is efficient, 
operates extremely quickly, and is automatic, working mostly outside of 
our conscious awareness. It monitors, decodes, evaluates, interprets, and 
otherwise tries to make some sense out of the nearly continuous input our 
brains receive from the environment without us having to pay attention or 
make any conscious decisions. The second type of cognitive processing 
(System 2) is what we experience as conscious attention29. It is relatively 
slow and effortful, allowing us to make controlled and deliberate decisions.  

 
Explicit bias. Explicit biases operate as part of System 2. These 

biases are what we typically think of as racism (the consciously held belief 
that members of certain racial or ethnic groups are inherently inferior) and 
other consciously endorsed biases. Over the past 50 years, levels of overt 
racism have declined dramatically in the US30. Nevertheless, some subtle 
(i.e. non-overt) forms of explicit racial biases persist. For example, rather 
than believing in an inherent inferiority of members of a racial or ethnic 
group, an individual may profess an adherence to “traditional American 
values such as self-reliance, the work ethic, and respect for authority”31, p. 

438 and the belief that members of some ethnic or racial groups tend to 
reject these values.32 Even after controlling for alternative predictors such 
as political ideology, age, sex, and income, individuals reporting these 
beliefs tend to object to social policies that more commonly support 
African Americans33 and instead favor punitive criminal policies (e.g. 
three-strikes laws) that disproportionally harm them.31 Evidence of explicit 
bias in the school discipline context may be seen in the relation between 
school rates of disproportionality and the principal’s endorsement of 
exclusionary discipline and zero tolerance policies.34  
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Because explicit biases operate as part of System 2 and therefore 
rely on consciously held values, their effects on judgment and decision-
making are resistant to change.35 Consistent with this theory, a range of 
studies show that interventions commonly used in schools (e.g. cultural 
sensitivity training, explaining the value of diversity), have little to no effect 
on levels of disproportionate treatment.18,19,20 By comparison, structured, 
top-down policy interventions that are implemented with the overt support 
of and accountability to administrators are more likely to reduce the effects 
of explicit bias. For example, a meta-analysis of intergroup contact (e.g. 
school integration) found that interventions implemented with strong intra-
institutional support, which limits the ability of individuals to avoid the 
intervention, were substantially more effective in reducing racial and ethnic 
discrimination.36 

 
Implicit Bias. Implicit biases are associated with System 1 (i.e. 

efficient, automatic) cognitive processing. Rather than conscious 
endorsement, they have their roots in generalized associations formed 
from systematically limited experience or exposure (e.g. regular 
experience with male but not female surgeons or female but not male 
kindergarten teachers may lead an individual to assume as a default that 
surgeons are male and teachers of young children are female, even 
though that individual may know some exceptions and support gender 
equity). Consistent with the functioning of System 2, given the various 
limitations on our ability to process information and the inferences that are 
used to function in a fast-paced world, these associations (e.g. 
stereotypes) act as shortcuts that help us to navigate the complexity of the 
world.22 In doing so, they can bias perception, judgment, and decision-
making without our conscious knowledge or intent.37, 38 This phenomenon 
is particularly true when people do not or cannot act deliberately, such as, 
“when a perceiver lacks the motivation, time, or cognitive capacity to think 
deeply (and accurately) about others.”39, p. 105, 21 Thus, however egalitarian 
their values, individuals’ implicit biases are more likely to affect their 
decisions when the structural demands of a situation exceed the available 
information (e.g. judgments that are inherently difficult, subjective, or 
ambiguous40), or when cognitive resources are limited (e.g. when 
decisions must be made quickly or individuals are physically or mentally 
fatigued22, 41). 

Implicit biases, such as those favoring Whites over African 
Americans, are typically measured in a way that does not allow for 
conscious deliberation (e.g. reaction times in a highly speeded task or 
associations with ambiguous stimuli). Performance on such measures 
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predict a wide variety of behaviors,38 including the tendency for 
pediatricians to recommend pain medication at lower rates for African 
American children than White children with identical symptoms,42 
discrimination against Arab-Muslim43 and obese44 job applicants, the 
extent to which labor arbitrators decide disputes in favor of women,45 and 
how much force police officers use when arresting children of color.46  

In the educational context, van den Bergh and colleagues47 
measured the explicit and implicit ethnic biases of a sample of elementary 
school teachers, along with their academic expectations for their students. 
In addition, the researchers obtained the students’ ethnicity, gender, 
socio-economic status, and standardized test scores. Controlling for 
student gender and socio-economic status, their analysis showed that 
teachers’ implicit, but not explicit, biases predicted the extent of the 
achievement gap between the teachers’ non-minority and minority ethnic 
students on the standardized tests. This effect was mediated by the lower 
expectations the teachers had for their ethnic minority students. Similarly, 
evidence that disproportionality is greater for discipline decisions related to 
more ambiguous or subjective student problem behaviors,48 which require 
teachers to make an inference or judgment call rather than rely on 
objective criterion, suggests that implicit bias also affects school discipline 
decisions.  

Because implicit bias can affect decision-making outside of 
conscious awareness, it can be difficult for individuals to know when and 
how to correct for it, even when they want to do so. Thus, in ambiguous or 
snap judgments, which facilitate the operation of implicit bias, simply 
making people accountable for making unbiased decisions, without more 
support, has been shown to be ineffective in reducing implicit bias in 
gender discrimination.45 Providing specific guidance as to how to make 
unbiased decisions in these situations, however, allows people who are 
motivated by equity to be unbiased.20,49,50 In addition, implicit biases also 
tend to be widely shared within society, even among members of minority 
groups.51 Consistent with this research, interventions that rely upon ethnic 
matching, such as hiring more non-White teachers and administrators, 
although laudable for many reasons, have not always been shown to 
remedy the problem.14 Even so, there are indications in other fields that 
focusing on counter-stereotypical examples (e.g. positive African 
American role models) can moderate implicit biases.20  
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A Conceptual Model of Factors Leading to Disproportionality and 

The dual-process perspective has direct implications for address
explicit and implicit bias
presents a conceptual model of variables related to disproportionality. 
Across the center, structural variable
characteristics, poverty, level of parental education) predict 
disproportionate discipline, leading to reduced levels of student 
achievement and increased rates of dropout
contacts with the justice
conceptualization of bias, disproportionality is also predicted by explicit 
and implicit bias. The effects of these less malleable predictors may be 
moderated (i.e. strengthened or weakened) by school policies and 
practices, with top-down policies moderating the effects of explicit bias, 
effective school and classroom practices moderating the effects of implicit 
bias, and both partially moderating the effects of structural variables. 
Thus, although certain structural con
be difficult to change, the model shows that understanding how they work 
is fundamentally necessary for identifying interventions that are most likely 
to reduce or eliminate disproportionate discipline, thereby improving 
student engagement, achievement, and opportunity.  

 
Figure 3: A Conceptual Model of Disproportionality
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 The conceptual model stresses how particular interventions may 
be effective or ineffective in reducing disproportionality. From the 
literature, effective top-down policies (e.g. evaluating administrators and 
teachers based on levels of disproportionality) are more likely to mitigate 
the effects of explicit bias. By comparison, policies without direction and 
accountability (e.g. inclusion of an equity goal into a school’s mission 
statement but without any strategies for enactment) are unlikely to make 
any difference. Moreover, policies that are effective for explicit bias will not 
necessarily reduce the effects of implicit bias.  

For implicit bias, the model describes that school practices are the 
best targets for intervention. For example, practices that involve creating 
clear guidelines for what incidents should be handled in the classroom 
versus issuing an ODR should reduce ambiguity in decision situations, 
and as a result, the influence of implicit bias. However, some policies that 
take decision making out of the hands of school personnel (e.g. zero 
tolerance policies) may also exacerbate the effects of explicit bias, making 
the problem worse. Finally, practices that involve defining and teaching 
students what is expected of them, including how to relate to adults and 
each other, may moderate the effects of both implicit bias (by adding 
clarity to interactions) and some structural variables, such as poverty (by 
educating students who may not have the knowledge or skills necessary 
to discern and navigate the behavioral norms in a school setting).  

 
Vulnerable Decision Points in School Discipline 

A potential intervention for reducing the effects of implicit bias on 
disproportionality is to provide guidance in making unbiased discipline 
decisions in ambiguous or snap-decision situations. General guidance 
(e.g. telling school personnel to be less biased) is not effective, but 
specific guidance may aid in such situations.20 Efficient and effective 
development of specific guidance requires a set of empirically-derived 
vulnerable decision points on which to focus training and implementation. 
For this article, we use the term vulnerable decision points to mean 
contextual events or elements of the immediate situation (e.g. teacher 
decision to refer to the office, administrator decision to suspend) that 
increase the likelihood of bias affecting discipline decision making. These 
vulnerable decision points momentarily increase the likelihood that an 
adult will make a biased discipline decision.  Many decisions to refer a 
student to the office involve snap judgments (invoking System 1), but 
some decision points may be more vulnerable to bias than others. 

The literature identifies some decision points that are most 
vulnerable to implicit bias and may be consistent across a range of 
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schools. In general, implicit biases tend to affect decisions that involve 
more uncertainty, ambiguity, or discretion. Consistent with the results of 
prior research,15,52 there is more likely to be disproportionality (particularly 
for African American students) in ODRs and suspensions for more 
subjective problem behaviors. In addition, time of day, representing onset 
of hunger or mental fatigue, has been shown in other fields (but not yet 
tested in education) to increase bias in decisions.22,41 Extrapolating to 
educational contexts, there may be more disproportionality in ODRs 
before lunch or at the end of the school day. Similarly, disproportionality 
may be more likely at the end of the week and end of the school year, 
when fatigue and stress tend to increase. Further, disproportionality could 
be greater for ODRs outside of the classroom because they are more 
often issued by adults who are not familiar with students (i.e. no personal 
connection) and thus more likely to rely on potentially negative racial or 
ethnic stereotypes than individualized knowledge about the specific 
student.53 At the school level, structural variables (e.g. grade levels 
served) may also influence implicit bias. For example, physically mature 
high school students may be perceived as more threatening to teachers, 
evoking more use of ODRs.54  

 
A Proposed Multicomponent Intervention to Prevent and Reduce 

Disproportionality 
The existing research and our conceptual model make it clear that that no 
single strategy may be sufficient to produce substantive and sustainable 
change. As such, we propose here a model with the assumption that 
multiple components may be needed, but not all components may be 
necessary in all schools. Our goal is to propose a set of intervention 
components that fit with the conceptual model proposed above, may spur 
the design of additional interventions addressing disproportionality and 
stimulate new research efforts on this issue. 

Discipline disproportionality results from an interaction between the 
behavior of students and the behavior of adults within schools. An 
“opportunity” for disproportionality exists when an adult acts on the 
assessment that a student’s behavior is unacceptable. Adults both identify 
a student’s behavior as unacceptable and assign a disciplinary response. 
Both of these adult behaviors expose opportunities for disproportionality. 
We propose a comprehensive, multicomponent approach to reducing 
disproportionality in schools with three major goals: (a) to prevent 
situations that can lead to disproportionate discipline, and, when such 
situations occur, reduce the likelihood that (b) explicit bias or (c) implicit 
bias will influence the outcome of the situation.  
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Prevent Situations that Can Lead to Disproportionate Discipline 

An obvious, but under-valued, component of any effort to reduce 
disproportionality is developing school-wide systems of academic and 
behavior support that reduce the likelihood of behavior judged 
unacceptable by adults. This approach includes both reducing student 
behavior that is genuinely unacceptable and developing shared 
expectations that help both students and adults differentiate between 
behaviors that are appropriate and inappropriate for school. If we can 
reduce the opportunities in which students may be sent to the office, we 
can reduce risk for disproportionality. Two major approaches in this regard 
are (a) effective academic instruction and (b) school-wide positive 
behavioral interventions and supports. 
 

Use effective instruction to address the achievement gap. 
Academic skill deficits are associated with increased risks of problem 
behavior and exclusionary discipline, but providing quality instruction can 
mitigate the behavioral risks for students who enter school with academic 
challenges.55 Because of the well-documented academic achievement 
gap between students of color and White students,56 ameliorating it may 
reduce disproportionality. As such, focusing on delivering high quality 
academic support to all students with academic deficits may 
simultaneously increase academic success and reduce their risk for ODRs 
and suspensions, reducing the additional risk for disproportionality based 
on academic failure. 

 
School-wide Positive Behavioral Interventions and Supports 

(SWPBIS). SWPBIS also holds promise as a prevention strategy for 
limiting the likelihood of opportunities for disproportionality. SWPBIS 
focuses on improving behavior by teaching students pro-social skills and 
redesigning school environments to discourage problem behavior.57 Core 
features of SWPBIS include (a) teaching a small set of positive, school-
wide behavioral expectations to all students, (b) establishing a regular 
pattern in which all adults acknowledge and reward appropriate student 
behavior, (c) minimizing the likelihood that problem behaviors will be 
inadvertently rewarded, and (d) collecting and using behavioral data to 
guide whole-school support efforts. SWPBIS also incorporates a multi-
tiered system of support so students needing more intensive support gain 
access to increasingly individualized support options. We recommend 
adopting a flexible, systems-level approach such as SWPBIS because it 
(a) is effective in reducing the use of exclusionary discipline (e.g. ODRs 
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and suspensions), (b) can be adapted to improve its fit with specific school 
and community cultures, and (c) provides the systems-level capacity for 
schools and districts to implement and monitor additional interventions to 
reduce disproportionality.58 

SWPBIS is particularly relevant to the challenge of 
disproportionality because of its focus on establishing a clear, consistent, 
and positive social culture. Identifying and teaching clear expectations can 
reduce ambiguity for both students (e.g. it is not assumed that all students 
know how to be respectful at school) and adults (e.g. expectations and 
violations are clearer, reducing ambiguity). The whole-school emphasis 
within SWPBIS also increases opportunities for both students and adults 
to see appropriate behavior modeled for them. In addition, systems for 
identifying and acknowledging positive behaviors by students, particularly 
students of color, may be particularly effective for countering the default 
formation and operation of negative stereotypes.20,59 

 
Effects on disproportionality. Although the effects of SWPBIS on 

academic achievement and behavior have been well documented,60 
research to date on the effects of SWPBIS on disproportionality have been 
promising but inconclusive. In descriptive case studies, SWPBIS is 
associated with reduced overall rates of ODRs and suspensions in 
schools in which the vast majority of students were non-White.61,62 Other 
descriptive studies have shown larger proportional reductions in 
suspensions for African American than White students.63 And a 
longitudinal, national evaluation of 69 elementary schools showed that 
through implementing SWPBIS, ODRs decreased over time for each 
racial/ethnic category.64 There is also quasi-experimental evidence that 
SWPBIS may reduce the extent of disproportionality. Vincent and 
colleagues65 found that disproportionality was statistically significantly 
smaller in schools implementing SWPBIS than those not implementing 
SWPBIS. Notably, however, disproportionality was not eliminated. The 
results of other studies have been mixed, with implementation of SWPBIS, 
or certain components of it, being shown to reduce disproportionality in 
some settings, grade levels, or both, but ineffective elsewhere.59,65  

Consistent with the conceptual model and multi-dimensional 
perspective, our view of the evidence is that typical implementation of 
SWPBIS has promise for reducing discipline disproportionality, but, to the 
extent it is not specifically targeted towards the different sources of 
disproportionality operating in a particular school (e.g. structural factors, 
explicit bias, implicit bias) it is unlikely to be as effective as it can be or to 
eliminate disproportionality completely. As such, typical implementations 
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of SWPBIS may function as an efficient first step toward reducing 
disproportionality, but may require additional strategies in some settings. 

 
Additional strategies. Two additional strategies are of special 

relevance for SWPBIS and disproportionality. First, it is important to 
develop school-wide expectations with active involvement of families, 
students, and the community. SWPBIS involves defining what behavior is 
and is not appropriate in educational settings and establishing 
consequences for adherence to or deviation from such behavior. When a 
school’s systems (e.g. expectations, matrix examples, acknowledgment 
systems) differ from those experienced by students outside of school, they 
are particularly vulnerable to exclusionary discipline. Students with 
challenging home lives, for example, may not know what behavior is 
expected or have the skills needed to do it. Similarly, those who are not 
from the dominant culture may be more likely to exhibit behavior that is 
perceived as respectful (or neutral) by them and their families but is 
viewed as problem behavior by other students and adults in the school.66 
The resulting discontinuity, in which behaviors of students who are 
economically and socially disadvantaged or culturally diverse are 
systematically labeled as norm-violating, can lead to disproportionality that 
institutionalizes explicit bias as well as the stereotypic associations that 
support implicit bias. Such mismatches may be reduced by examining and 
exploring school expectations with community representatives to ensure 
that they are congruent with those of local families and the greater 
community. Second, because focusing on counter-stereotypical examples 
tends to reduce bias,20 a strategy that may be helpful is counter-
stereotypical acknowledgment. This strategy includes actively 
encouraging the use of the school’s SWPBIS formal acknowledgement 
system for students from groups with disproportionate ODRs.59 This small 
change could (a) make school more reinforcing for these students and (b) 
help school personnel recognize more appropriate than problem behavior 
from students, changing their underlying assumptions, biases, and 
ultimately perceptions of ambiguous student behavior.  

 
Reduce Effects of Explicit Bias 
Although it is reasonable to provide professional development to address 
explicit bias (e.g. cultural responsiveness training), such strategies have 
not been shown to reduce biased behavior.19,20 Instead, formal policies 
and procedures may be more effective.67,49 Promising policies include: (a) 
regular collection and reporting of discipline data disaggregated by race 
and (b) district policies that support equity and have accountability.   
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Collect and use disaggregated student data.  The single most 

efficient process for achieving a valued outcome within a complex system 
is to define measure and report progress toward achieving that outcome 
on a regular cycle.68 Any school or district committed to reducing 
disproportionality should consider establishing data systems that allow 
disaggregation of student data by race. Some discipline data systems for 
entering and analyzing office discipline referrals and suspensions, such as 
the School-wide Information System (SWIS), can automatically produce 
disproportionality data for identifying and monitoring the extent of 
disproportionality. Risk indices or risk ratios (which are easily calculated 
from risk indices) are common metrics for assessing disproportionality.69 
Like the “diversity dashboards” recommended for traditionally male-
dominated businesses to motivate and track the effectiveness of programs 
to ensure gender equality,70,71 these data can easily be added to monthly 
school team meeting agendas, as well as built into district and state 
accountability systems. The National Technical Assistance Center on 
PBIS has developed a guide for using school discipline data to assess and 
address disproportionality.72 

 
Develop district policies with accountability for disciplinary 

equity.  Many schools and districts include a commitment to educational 
equity in their mission statements. However, research shows that this 
strategy alone is ineffective.19,20 Instead, policies that state this 
commitment but have clear steps to achieve equity and accountability for 
taking these steps are needed.67,49  Although there is little research testing 
these insights in schools, we believe that policies that are more likely to be 
effective include three key components. First, the mission statement can 
include a prominently stated commitment to equity. This institutional 
commitment to equity nullifies any ambiguity and provides the authority for 
both personal and organizational self-assessment. Second, the policies 
include clear, actionable procedures for enhancing equity (e.g. remove 
harmful practices, data collection, hiring preferences, professional 
development). Hiring procedures should include a preference for 
individuals with a commitment to educational equity. Professional 
development investment should include opportunities for personnel to 
assess the cultural responsiveness of their overall school culture and their 
own instructional practices. Third, the procedures should have true 
accountability, such as inclusion of training attendance and equity 
outcomes into administrator and teacher evaluation processes in order to 
reduce opportunities for individuals with high explicit bias to act on them.36 
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Reduce Effects of Implicit Bias 
As the model describes, different strategies may be needed for addressing 
implicit, or unconscious, bias. Because implicit bias is more likely in some 
situations rather than others,15 a necessary precursor of effective implicit 
bias intervention is to identify the situations (i.e. the vulnerable decision 
points) that are most likely to be affected by implicit bias. Once identified 
(either through national or school-specific analyses72), a few strategies 
can be used to address bias in these specific situations.  
 

Identify school-specific vulnerable decision points. School 
teams can assess their vulnerable decision points if their discipline data 
system allows drill downs of situational information regarding each 
incident of problem behavior (e.g. student, grade, problem behavior, date, 
time of day, referring staff) and the administrative consequences (e.g. 
suspensions). Teams can use these data with their risk indices and ratios 
to identify specific situations where disproportionality is more likely to 
occur.72   

 
Reduce ambiguity in discipline procedures. Once these 

decision points are identified, school or district staff can examine their 
ODR definitions and processes (e.g. definitions of defiance, distinctions 
between classroom and office managed behavior) to reduce ambiguity in 
these specific decision points. Decision points with more ambiguity (e.g. 
vague procedures) are more likely to result in biased decisions.20 As a 
result, this strategy can be useful when relying on national research (e.g. 
responding to subjective behaviors) but is more likely to be effective if 
decision points are derived from the school’s own data regarding where 
disproportionality is most likely to occur. 

 
Teach neutralizing routines for vulnerable decision points. In 

addition to clarifying procedures, research indicates that it may be 
effective to use the school’s data to teach school personnel to identify 
when they are in a vulnerable decision point (e.g. fatigued, unfamiliar 
student, subjective behavior) and use a self-review routine just prior to a 
making a discipline decision. Such if-then routines, frequently called 
“implementation intentions,”73 may neutralize the likelihood of 
disproportionate discipline from implicit bias, especially in situations that 
are chaotic, ambiguous, or seem to demand snap judgments.20 
Establishing neutralizing routines requires that the school staff identify a 
specific set of vulnerable decision points and develop a brief set of self-
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instructed questions and alternatives for all staff to use in discipline 
decisions. Although there is no research in education regarding specific 
language to use, research in law enforcement suggest that short if-then 
statements are most effective. One example may be the following: “Is this 
a vulnerable decision point? If so, use [predetermined alternative strategy] 
to keep this student in class.” Much more research is needed to validate 
and understand these procedures, but preliminary studies employing 
neutralizing routines are encouraging.73 
 

Conclusion 
Disproportionality in school discipline remains a pressing problem, with 
devastating consequences in terms of school completion and 
incarceration. Rather than focusing solely on less malleable factors, our 
multidimensional approach provides significant guidance by identifying 
more malleable intervention targets, such as decision situations that are 
more prone to bias, and shows how certain policies and practices may 
reduce the effects of bias on decision making. Further work will be 
necessary to validate this conceptual model and test the proposed 
intervention components it suggests, including those outlined here, with a 
formal and substantial program of research. Doing so will establish an 
evidence-based framework for more precise—and thereby, more efficient 
and effective—interventions to reduce disproportionality in school 
discipline. 
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